
Memphis‐Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2023‐2024 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand           
(Manufacturer Product 

Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2023-2024)

Bidder Bidder 
Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 

Product Code
Pack                    
Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

Per Case

Cost Per 
Serving/Pounds Cost Per Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended Total 
Cost Comments

LEAD TIME 
FROM ORDER 

(IN WEEKS)
Award

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested 
In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non 

Acceptable Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre‐
Approved Brands, 
MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as 
long as it meets the bid 
specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

1027 SERVINGS

Muffin, WG, Carrot, IW- Whole grain carrot muffin.  
Individually wrapped.  Must meet 1 oz grain equivalent 
for the child nutrition program.  Product formulation 
statement or CN Label required.  Approximate pack size: 
96/case.

Ship Lot:  400 Cases 

Muffintown -02611

250,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1027 SERVINGS

Muffin, WG, Carrot, IW- Whole grain carrot muffin.  
Individually wrapped.  Must meet 1 oz grain equivalent 
for the child nutrition program.  Product formulation 
statement or CN Label required.  Approximate pack size: 
96/case.

Ship Lot:  400 Cases 

Muffintown -02611

250,000 Muffin Town Net 30 days Smart Choice #02611 96ct.-2oz. IW 96 0.283 $27.17 2,604 $70,750.68 12 pallet combined minimum 21 days Award

1041 SERVINGS

Vegetable Blend, California - Frozen, IQF, broccoli 
florettes, cauliflower florettes and crinkle carrot slices.  
Packed to Grade A standard. Serving size must equal 
1/2 cup vegetable equivalent for the Child nutrition 
program. Pack 12/2 lb bags. Approximately 125 servings 
per case. If packed differently please indicate.

Ship Lot:  400 

Simplot 10071179188339

400,000      $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!   

1041 SERVINGS

Vegetable Blend, California - Frozen, IQF, broccoli 
florettes, cauliflower florettes and crinkle carrot slices.  
Packed to Grade A standard. Serving size must equal 
1/2 cup vegetable equivalent for the Child nutrition 
program. Pack 12/2 lb bags. Approximately 125 servings 
per case. If packed differently please indicate.

Ship Lot:  400 

Simplot 10071179188339

400,000 Robbins Sales Co, Inc. N30 Garden Fresh 37369 12/2lbs 24 $1.13 $27.12 16,667 $452,000.00

Sample submitted
and passed. Add as 
an approved brand.
Cost listed is by the 
pound. Actual serving 
cost is .22 cents.

  

2 Award

1041 SERVINGS

Vegetable Blend, California - Frozen, IQF, broccoli 
florettes, cauliflower florettes and crinkle carrot slices.  
Packed to Grade A standard. Serving size must equal 
1/2 cup vegetable equivalent for the Child nutrition 
program. Pack 12/2 lb bags. Approximately 125 servings 
per case. If packed differently please indicate.

Ship Lot:  400 

Simplot 10071179188339

400,000 Simplot

2% 10 net 15 
days from 

invoice or 30 
days net

Simplot Simple Goodness 
Blend California 10071179188339 12/2# 24 $1.31 $31.56 16,667 $525,920.00

Cost listed is by the 
pound. Actual serving 
cost is .25 cents.

  

1071 SERVINGS

Chicken,Shredded, Sous Vide- Unseasoned, low 
sodium frozen, pulled chicken pieces.  An equal blend of 
dark to white meat. All natural with no antibiotics. 
Serving size to equal 2 oz.meat/meat alternate for the 
Child Nutrition program. CN label or Product 
Formulation Sheet (PFS)  required for crediting. Please 
indicate number of servings per case. 

Ship Lot: 300

Comida Vida 470490

200,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1 of 5



Memphis‐Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2023‐2024 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Frozen By the Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand           
(Manufacturer Product 

Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings 
 (2023-2024)

Bidder Bidder 
Terms Bidder Brand  Manufacturer's 

Product Code
Pack                    
Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

Per Case

Cost Per 
Serving/Pounds Cost Per Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended Total 
Cost Comments

LEAD TIME 
FROM ORDER 

(IN WEEKS)
Award

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being Requested 
In The Specifications Below Will Be Considered A Non 

Acceptable Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre‐
Approved Brands, 
MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as 
long as it meets the bid 
specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS ARE IN 
CASES.

1071 SERVINGS

Chicken,Shredded, Sous Vide- Unseasoned, low 
sodium frozen pulled chicken pieces.  A blend of 65/35 
dark to white blend.  All natural with no antibiotics.  
Serving to equal 2 oz.m/ma for the CN program.  CN 
Labeled or product formulation sheet required for 
crediting.

Ship Lot: 300

Comida Vida 470490

200,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING NET 30 COMIDA VIDA 470490 5/7.4LB BAGS 293 $0.64 $188.00 683 $128,327.65 MIN  160 CS 14-21 DAYS 

1071 SERVINGS

Chicken,Shredded, Sous Vide- Unseasoned, low 
sodium frozen, pulled chicken pieces.  An equal blend of 
dark to white meat. All natural with no antibiotics. 
Serving size to equal 2 oz.meat/meat alternate for the 
Child Nutrition program. CN label or Product 
Formulation Sheet (PFS)  required for crediting. Please 
indicate number of servings per case. 

Ship Lot: 300

Comida Vida 470490

200,000 International Food 
Solutions, Inc. Comida Vida 470490 5/7.40# Bag 293 $0.62 $182.04 683 $124,333.32

 

3-4 Business 
Weeks

Award

1493 SERVINGS

Stir Fry Vegetable Blend - Frozen, IQF should contain 
broccoli florets, kernel corn, diced red peppers, shelled 
edamame and matchstick carrots. Must provide crediting 
statement.
Approximate Packed 6/2.5 lb. pkgs./case. 

Ship Lot: 300 

Simplot 10071179607762
Norpac Foods, Inc./ Flav R 
Pac (3398)                               

200,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1493 SERVINGS

Stir Fry Vegetable Blend - Frozen, IQF should contain 
broccoli florets, kernel corn, diced red peppers, shelled 
edamame and matchstick carrots. Must provide crediting 
statement.
Approximate Packed 6/2.5 lb. pkgs./case. 

Ship Lot: 300 

Simplot 10071179607762
Norpac Foods, Inc./ Flav R 
Pac (3398)                               

200,000 Simplot

2% 10 net 15 
days from 

invoice or 30 
days net

Simplot Simple Goodness 
Kyoto Blend 10071179607762 6/2.5# 15 $1.75 $26.25 13,333 $350,000.00

Cost listed is by the 
pound. Actual serving 

cost is .34 cents.
Award

1879 SERVINGS

Soup, Baked Potato, Frozen- In 8/4 IB boil in bags. 
Must meet 1 oz meat/meat alternative and 1/2 cup 
vegetable per serving.

Ship Lot: 400

MMI Culinary CN80006

200,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1879 SERVINGS

Soup, Baked Potato, Frozen- In 8/4 IB boil in bags. 
Must meet 1 oz meat/meat alternative and 1/2 cup 
vegetable per serving.

Ship Lot: 400

MMI Culinary CN80006

200,000 Sysco Memphis LLC net 14 Norpac Food, Inc. 117107 4/4# 64.00 $0.96 $61.46 3,125 $192,062.50
No Sample Sent 

new item setup 

4 weeks No Award

160 
cases 
Minimum 
Delivery 
per Drop. 
See 
Order 

Pricing is not valid 
through DOT Foods, a 
redistributor- See 
Deviation Statement 
Correct Ext. Price -
$182.04 * 683cs = 
$124,333.32
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Memphis‐Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2023‐2024 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Dry By the Serving or Each

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand
(Manufacture Product Code) Estimated Number of 

Servings 
(2023-2024)

Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

per Case

Cost
Per

Serving/Pounds

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Award

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is 
Being Requested In The Specifications Below 
Will Be Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor 

Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT 

CURRENT AWARDS.  ALL PACK 
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY 

CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-Approved 
Brands, MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as long as 
it meets the bid specification 
and (2) tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

1052 SERVINGS

Cinnamon Brown Sugar - Crackers,cinnamon 
brown sugar flavored - Made with whole grain 
wheat flour. No character shapes. Individual packet 
servings. Must meet 1 oz. grain eq. for the Child 
Nutrition program and must meet smart snack 
guidelines.  Please provide crediting.

Approximate Pack: 120/case

Ship Lot: 300

Belvita 93200027600/ 2769

150,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1052 SERVINGS

Cinnamon Brown Sugar - Crackers,cinnamon 
brown sugar flavored - Made with whole grain 
wheat flour. No character shapes. Individual packet 
servings. Must meet 1 oz. grain eq. for the Child 
Nutrition program and must meet smart snack 
guidelines.  Please provide crediting.

Approximate Pack: 120/case

Ship Lot: 300

Belvita 93200027600/ 2769

150,000 CHURCHFIELD 
TRADING NET 30 DARLINGTON 71000 108/1oz bags 108 $0.28 $30.24 1389 $42,003.36

Sample 
submitted. 

Sample passed.

MIN ORDER 432 CS    
**CAN COMBINE WITH 
OTHER 2 AWARDED 

ITEMS FOR 
DARLINGTON FROM 

MISC #1 BID TO MAKE 
MIN ORDER.

Award

1224 SERVINGS

Chili Lime Seasoning - Reduced Sodium - with 
chili peppers, lime, and sea salt. Individual packets, 
1 gram. Approximately 1000 per case. Serving size 
= 1 packet.

Ship Lot: 200

Tajin 28805

400,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
No Bid 

1225 SERVINGS

Chamoy Hot Sauce - Fruity - Must contain chili 
peppers, lime, sea salt, and fruit flavor. Must be 
gluten free and no artificial colors or flavors. 
Individual packets, .27oz. Approximately 500 per 
case. Serving size = 1 packet.

Ship Lot: 200

Tajin 4810212

200,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
No Bid 

1303 SERVINGS

Taco Sauce, Mild- Made with tomato sauce, 
spices, and vinegar. Peppers may be listed as 
ingredient but not required. 1/3 ounce,  200 
packages per case.

Ship Lot: 500                                    

Del Pasado 273025
Del Pasado 271876

250,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
No Bid 

1400 SERVINGS

Tortilla Flour, Street-style- Each tortilla must be 
4.5" in diameter and meet a minimum of 1/2 oz. 
grain equivalents per child nutrition program 
standards.  CN label or grain crediting statement 
required.  Please bid based on serving size of 1 oz. 
(2-1/2 oz. tortillas). Approximate pack 6/24 count 
per case.

Ship Lot: 300 

Del Pasado 597011
La Banderita 128

300,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
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Memphis‐Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services

2023‐2024 Miscellaneous Food Bid II
Dry By the Serving or Each

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand
(Manufacture Product Code) Estimated Number of 

Servings 
(2023-2024)

Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder 
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

per Case

Cost
Per

Serving/Pounds

Cost
Per

Case

Required 
Number of 

Cases

Extended
 Total
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER 
(IN WEEKS)

Award

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

1400 SERVINGS

Tortilla Flour, Street-style- Each tortilla must be 
4.5" in diameter and meet a minimum of 1/2 oz. 
grain equivalents per child nutrition program 
standards.  CN label or grain crediting statement 
required.  Please bid based on serving size of 1 oz. 
(2-1/2 oz. tortillas). Approximate pack 6/24 count 
per case.

Ship Lot: 300 

Del Pasado 597011
La Banderita 128

300,000 Sysco Memphis, 
LLC net 14 Ole Mexican Foods 128 16/20ct 160 0.11105 $17.77 1875 $33,315.00 3 weeks

Award

1425 SERVINGS

Granola Crispy Bites - Whole grain crispy granola 
cookie bites.  To meet 1oz grain equivalent for the 
child nutrition program.  CN label or grain crediting 
statement required.  Approximate pack 108/case.

Ship Lot: 300

No Approved Brands

250,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1425 SERVINGS

Granola Crispy Bites - Whole grain crispy granola 
cookie bites.  To meet 1oz grain equivalent for the 
child nutrition program.  CN label or grain crediting 
statement required.  Approximate pack 108/case.

Ship Lot: 300

No Approved Brands

250,000 ES Foods Net 30 Cooper Street 3288/3301/3325 150/1 oz 150 0.4079 $61.19 1666.666667 $101,975.00

Sample Submitted.
Sample Failed.

Min:  7 Pallets (588 
cases)

3 weeks
No Award

1887 SERVINGS

Milk, Chocolate Shelf Stable -  Aseptic pack 
chocolate milk. To contain all nutrients to qualify as 
reimbursable through the USDA Child Nutrition 
program as fluid milk.

Ship Lot:  200

Hersheys 1003                                     
Horizon 6355857                                  
Horizon 136917                                    
Uht 63007

350,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!

1887 SERVINGS

Milk, Chocolate Shelf Stable -  Aseptic pack 
chocolate milk. To contain all nutrients to qualify as 
reimbursable through the USDA Child Nutrition 
program as fluid milk.

Ship Lot:  200

Hersheys 1003                                     
Horizon 6355857                                  
Horizon 136917                                    
Uht 63007

350,000 Sysco Memphis 
LLC net 14 Tru Moo 10440 27x8 27.00 $0.82 $22.14 12962.96296 $287,000.00

Will not purchase  
truckload of quantities. 

Will purchase from 
Dairy.

truckload only - 120 
cases per pallet; 22 
pallets = full truck

3 weeks
No Award

1887 SERVINGS

Milk, Chocolate Shelf Stable -  Aseptic pack 
chocolate milk. To contain all nutrients to qualify as 
reimbursable through the USDA Child Nutrition 
program as fluid milk.

Ship Lot:  200

Hersheys 1003                                     
Horizon 6355857                                  
Horizon 136917                                    
Uht 63007

350,000 ES Foods Net 30 Breakfast Breaks 63007 27/8 oz 27.00 $0.66 $17.74 12962.96296 $229,950.00

Will not purchase  
truckload of quantities. 

Will purchase from 
dairy

Min:  Truckload - 2640 
cases (22 Pallets)

3 weeks
No Award
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Memphis‐Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
Division of Nutrition Services
2023‐2024 Miscellaneous Bid II
Refrigerated By the Serving

Stock Number Unit Description
Approved Brand

(Manufacture Product 
Code)

Estimated Number of 
Servings 

(2023-2024)
Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code

Pack              
Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds 

per Case

Cost Per
Serving/Pounds

Cost per 
Case

Required 
Number of       

 Cases

Extended 
Total Cost Comments

LEAD TIME FROM 
ORDER 

(IN WEEKS)

Award

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From 
What Is Being Requested In The 

Specifications Below Will Be 
Considered A Non Acceptable 

Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING 

SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT 

AWARDS.  ALL PACK 
SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY 

CONSIDERED AND 
EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS will 
accept an approved equal (1) 

as long as it meets the bid 
specification and (2) tested 

and approved through 
MSCS's Sample Submission 
Process. To be considered 

for the bid, a sample must be 
submitted for any item with 
no approved brand listed.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

1317 SERVINGS

Hummus, Roasted Red Peppers with 
Pretzels  Mixture of hummus, cooked 
chickpeas, tahini, red bell pepper, 
garlic, and salt.  Each serving to equal 
a minimum of 1.5 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1.5 oz. grain equivalents 
per the child nutrition guidelines. 
Serving size must meet a minimum of 
4.56 oz.  Please provide CN label or 
product formulation sheet for crediting.
Please indicate servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 

Sabra 01196

75,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
No Bid 

1817 SERVINGS

Cheese, Sliced, Pepperjack - Slices to 
equal 1/2 oz. CN Label or crediting 
statement required to show the serving 
size of 1/2 oz. M/MA.  Packed: 4-5 
pound blocks.  Packed 960 1/2 oz. 
slices/case.  Serving = 1 slice.                

Ship Lot:  200

Bongards 114441
Roseli 347677

150,000 $0.00 #DIV/0! #DIV/0!
No Bid 
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